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The purpose of the study was to evaluate the surface detail 
reproduction, gypsum compatibility and dimensional stability 

of two conventional and one extended pour alginates at different 
storage time (0, 1, 3, 5 days respectively). Three alginate materials 
Coltoprint, Jeltrate and Hydrogum % were tested for surface detail 
reproduction, gypsum compatibility and dimensional stability in 
accordance with American National Standards Institute American 
Dental Association (ANSI/ADA) specification number 18 and 19. 
The gypsum compatibility was tested using type III dental stone. 
The parameters tested were analysed between the groups using 
one way ANOVA & Tukeys post hoc. A repeated measure ANOVA 
was used for time periods. Alginate type and storage times 
significantly affected the dimensional stability of impressions and 
compatibility of casts (p<0.001). In all alginate, no statistically 
significant differences were found with impressions poured 
after 0 hours (control) and one day of storage (p>0.05). However, 
after 3 days and 5 day of storage, Hydrogum 5 was found to be 
significantly different (P<0.05). Moreover, comparing materials 

there was no significant difference up to 5 days (p>0.05). However, 
Hydrogum 5 may be poured after 5 days, but Coltoprint and Jeltrate 
should be poured immediately and the storage time should not be 
more than 24 hours. All the three test materials exhibited linear 
dimensional change within the ADA’s accepted limit of 1.0%. 
Immediate pouring of alginate provides the highest accuracy in 
reproducing the teeth and adjacent tissues, with less variability 
in linear dimensional change. However, this study demonstrates 
that pouring may be delayed for up to 5 days using extended pour 
(Hydrogum 5) alginates.
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